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Battles of the Somme in 1916. June 1, Senator 
Mariana Jodoin, 84, Montreal, Senator Thomas 
Alexander Crerar, 89, Winnipeg, Senator Clarence 
Veniot, 80, Bathurst, N.B., and Senator William 
H, Taylor, 76, Brantford, Ont., retired from the 
Senate. June 2, U.S. satellite Surveyor I launched 
May 30, landed on the moon and returned photos 
indicating that the surface seemed suitable for 
landings of manned craft. Unveiling of portrait 
of former Speaker Alan Macnaughton, painted by 
Lillias Newton of Ottawa, to be hung in the 
gallery of former Speakers in the Centre Block. 
June S-5, Two U.S. astronauts in the Gemini 9 
rocket in three-day flight which included rendez­
vous with a target satellite and a walk in space, 
the latter cut short by defective faceplate. June 
5, Andre1 Durocher, convicted holdup man and 
escape-mate of Lucien Rivard, found hanged in 
QPP Headquarters the day before he was to be 
charged with the deaths of Andre Paquette and 
Alice Rioux, whose bodies were found buried near 
Piedmont, north of Montreal. Provincial election 
in Quebec; Union Nationale Par ty under Daniel 
Johnson elected. Edwin Godfrey Newman, Bella 
Bella, B.C., became the first native Indian to be 
appointed a magistrate and judge of the family 
and children's court. June 6, The 75th anniver­
sary of the death of Sir John A. Macdonald com­
memorated at Queen's Park in Toronto. $12,000,-
000 bequest to the Canada Council from the late 
Dorothy J. Killam announced. June 7, The 
Presbyterian Church voted 133-72 in favour of 
ordination of women. Twenty-six of 27 men 
charged with criminal contempt for picketing a 
Peterborough plastics plant in defiance of a court 
order were found guilty. June 8, The Centenary 
of the first convening of Parliament in Ottawa 
noted by Rt . Hon. J . G. Diefenbaker in the 
House of Commons. June 9, First woman to 
hold the post of foreign ambassador to Canada, 
Dora Alencar de Vasconcellos of Brazil, arrived in 
Ottawa. June 10, The federal Department of 
Justice announced launching of investigation into 
alleged multi-million-dollar credit frauds by some 
bankrupt firms. Agreement signed by the CPR 
and the National Harbours Board ended 30-year 
legal argument over ownership of Vancouver's 
waterfront and paved the way for redevelopment 
of the area. June 11, Dave Bailey, Toronto, 
became the first Canadian to break the four-
minute mile (3:59.1). At Springfield, 111., Prime 
Minister Pearson received one of the 1966 Atlantic 
Union Pioneer Awards for leadership in uniting 
NATO countries into a federal union. June 12, 
Death of Daniel Leo Dolan, career public servant 
and diplomat who organized and became Director 
of the Canadian Travel Bureau. June IS, Dr. 
Geoffrey Hattersley-Smith of the Defence Research 
Board presented with a Royal Geographical 
Society gold medal for his glaciological investiga­
tions in the Canadian Arctic. June 14, The 39-
day strike of Quebec longshoremen, halting oper­
ations in the ports of Montreal, Quebec and Trois-
RiviSres, ended with the granting of a 34-p.c. 
increase and establishment of a federal inquiry to 
negotiate other problems. June IS, Mr. Justice 
Meunier of the Quebec Superior Court, convicted 
of perjury in 1964, granted a new trial by the 
Quebec Appeal Court. External Affairs Minister 
Martin confirmed in the House of Commons that 
Chester Ronning, retired diplomat and expert on 
Far Eastern affairs, was on a mission for the Federal 
Government believed to be connected with possible 
peace negotiations in North Viet-Nam. June 16, 
A strike of 4,253 sales employees of Air Canada 
that threatened to ground the airline averted by a 
last-minute wage settlement. Threatened strike 
of St. Lawrence Seaway operating employees 
averted by an agreement increasing wages by 20 
P.O. retroactive to Jan. 1 and an additional 10 p.c. 
in 1937. June 19, Ceremony held in Toronto 
marking 75th anniversary of the first Ukrainian 
settlers in Canada. June 20, Conclusion of a 
1800,000,000 contract between Canada and the 

U.S.S.R. for the purchase of Canadian wheat and 
flour announced. June 21, Designation of the 
birthplace of Col. John McCrae, author of the 
poem In Flanders Fields, a t Guelph, Ont., as a 
national historic site; to be restored in co-operation 
with the City of Guelph. June 22, Senator Keith 
Davey accepted the commissionership of the 
Canadian Football League. June 23, Provincial 
election held in Manitoba; Premier Duff Roblin's 
Progressive Conservative government returned for 
a fourth term. June 25, Titled Hero, Canadian-
bred horse owned by Peter K. Marshall, Toronto, 
won Queen's Plate. June 27, Russian parlia­
mentarians led by Dmitry Polyansky began 10-
day visit to Canada. 

J u l y : July 5, The late Busher Jackson and Fred Cook 
elected to Hockey Hall of Fame. July 6, Prime 
Minister Pearson announced grants and develop­
ment loans to Commonwealth countries in the 
Caribbean to the extent of $71,000,000 over five 
years. July 6-8, Canada-Commonwealth Carib­
bean Conference held in Ottawa. July 7, A Bill 
to incorporate the Bank of Western Canada— 
Canada's ninth bank and the first new Canadian-
financed bank in 50 years—passed by the Senate. 
July 8, Eleven staff members of This Hour Has 
Seven Days left or were dismissed by the CBC. 
July 9-10, Memorandum of Association signifying 
the union of the two largest Civil Service staff 
associations—the Civil Service Federation and the 
Civil Service Association and their affiliates—with 
a membership of some 115,000, signed. July 11, 
Death of Gen. A. G. L. McNaughton, scientist, 
former President of the National Research Council, 
Commander of the first Canadian Army Overseas 
in World War I I and Canadian Chairman of the 
International Joint Commission. July 12, Agree­
ment signed between Canada and Trinidad and 
Tobago under which Canada will supply modern 
port-handling equipment up to an amount of 
$350,000 to Port-of-Spain. July IS, Loan agree­
ment signed making $600,000 available for the 
expansion of the school system in Jamaica. Parlia­
mentary Committee on Consumer Credit given a 
special mandate to investigate living costs; study 
opened Sept. 28, with food prices the first topic of 
inquiry. July 14, Mrs. J. E . Ahern of Halifax 
appointed judge of the Halifax Citizenship Court, 
the first woman to be appointed to such office in 
Canada. July 15, An Act to set up a Crown 
agency to operate the $36,000,000 National Arts 
Centre in Ottawa received Royal Assent. Four 
Rear Admirals confirmed their requests for early 
retirement in the dispute with Defence Minister 
Hellyer over integration of the Armed Forces. 
July 15-18, Non-medical workers a t Quebec hos­
pitals, including seven in the Montreal area, went 
on strike, demanding increased wages and a new 
work contract. July 16, Federal grant of 
$2,000,000 to the endowment of the Vanier Insti­
tute of The Family approved. July 21, George 
and Viola MacMillan, prominent figures in the 
Canadian mining industry, committed for trial on 
two charges each of fraud in influencing the market 
price of Windfall Oils and Mines shares. July 22, 
U.S. astronauts completed a three-day trip in 
Gemini 10 after setting an altitude record and 
achieving the first dual rendezvous. July 25, 
Farmers in various parts of Ontario obstructed 
highway traffic with tractors in demonstrations of 
protest against provincial agriculture policies; 
others on July 27 marched to the Legislative 
Buildings. Martine van Hamel, Toronto, won 
junior class of international ballet competition in 
Bulgaria. External Affairs Minister Mart in an­
nounced an additional grant in aid available to 
Zambia to help with "the economic problems result­
ing from actions of the Smith regime in Rhodesia". 
July 26, Report of Mr. Justice Dalton Wells found 
George Victor Spencer, former federal postal 
clerk, guilty of gross misconduct in supplying in­
formation to Russia and that the government of 
this country would have been culpable if they had 


